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Sympathy is extended to Robert Thomas 

(410 Pinchurst Dr, New Ulm, Texas, 
78950) on the passing of his Wife, Dr. 

Rachel Armstrong Thomas, who went to 

be with her Lord and Savior Tuesday, 

January 19.  Loving daughter-in-law to 

Fred & Doreen Thomas (131 Maxwell, 
Apt 3, E7M 0B6), sister-in-law to Anna 

Andow, Joan & Allan Sheen, Ruth &  

Elbert Belaskie and extended family and 

friends. 

Worship Service Sunday, January 24, 2021  

Online Only:  Join us at 9:00 AM  

woodstockbaptist.ca/watch-live/  or  find us on Facebook. 

N O T ICE  
 

Annual Business meeting and all in person gatherings  

are postponed until further notice.  

CBM PRAYERLINE 

Pray for Carla Nelson, Senior Associate, 
Liaison & Educational Specialist serving in 
Africa.  Gracious God: 

You have invited all who are weary to 
come to you, to lay before you our bur-
dens, and to take on your yoke of rest. So, 
I come bringing before you my wrestling 
heart. 

Forgive my self-pity over the inconven-
ience of being home-bound and mask-
adorned while basking in the comfort and 
safety of my circumstance.  

Change my selfish heart to focus on those 
facing real hardship and devastation. And 
widen my capacity to hold the bigger pic-
ture.  I come bringing before you those in 
our world who are the most vulnerable. 
Hear their cries for peace and for security. 
Heal all who are sick. Deliver them from 
the anxiety of tomorrow. Protect them from 
those who injure and kill. Feed their chil-
dren. 

Make way for health through clean drinking 
water, medicines and vaccinations. Pre-
pare the land so that it may be able to pro-
duce food. Comfort those who mourn. 

Provide for them through your miraculous 
ways and us, your servants. I come bring-
ing before you our church partners in Afri-
ca. Receive their worship of you, O God, 
for they know from whom all blessings 
flow. Grant them wisdom to navigate the 
challenges that are before them. Support 
their ministry initiatives. Look after their 
leaders. Care for the widows and orphans. 
Protect their joy, optimism and kind-
heartedness.  I come bringing before you 
our Canadian Baptist Christian witness in 
Canada and around the world. Bestow on 
us generosity of spirit. Honour the efforts of 
service done in your name. I come bringing 
my desire to be your person in this place 
and at this time.  May it be so. Amen. 

 

Pray for the staff, faculty, and board of 

Crandall University. Pray for President Dr. 

Bruce Fawcett as he leads, and pray for 

those who are teaching and supporting 

the students in their education. The work 

of Crandall University is a key part of our 

CBAC family. 

Welcome to our Online Service 

SCRIPTURE:  Psalm 122 

Rev. Craig Woodcock

PLEASE PRAY FOR OUR KNOWN SICK: 

 At Home:  Shirley McKenzie , Eldon 

Higgs, Faye Bell, Vaughn Graham, 

Wayne Rennie, Audrey Cummings and 

Libby Sealy. 

WHAT’S HAPPENING AT WBC 

 Join Tiffany via Zoom this Sunday at 

10:30 AM.  Email for connection de-

tails:  tiffany.sears3@gmail.com 
 

 Monday at 7:00 PM via Zoom.  Con-

tact Pastor Nick for connection details:       
nicholas.devine29@gmail.com           

 

 

Ladies Bible Study:  

 Thursday at 9:00 AM via Zoom.  Con-

tact Corinne for connection details:  

jeffcor.gray@gmail.com 

 

Adult Life Groups: 

 Check out the back cover for studies 

that may interest you.  Click on link to 

register:  https://woodstockbaptist.ca/

lifegroupsignup/ 

Sympathy is extended to Garry & Mar-

lene Smith (2174 Rte 560, Lakeville, E7K 
1W8) and Dave & Krissy Andow (282 
Bedell Settlement Rd, Jackson Falls, 
E7M 5S7) on the passing of Mother and 

Grandmother, Nellie Smith, Monday, 

January 18. 

Options for Giving 
 

e-Transfer:   wbc.etransfer@gmail.com  /    Online:   woodstockbaptist.ca/give/  

Preauthorized Debit Forms:   woodstockbaptist.ca/give/ 

Mail:  694 Main St, Woodstock, E7M 2E3 

Pray for 

Peace in  

Jerusalem 

Psalm 122: 6 

Congratulat ions  

Congratulations and best wishes to Jon & Katie Thomas on the birth of their 

daughter, Khloe Marie.  Born Wednesday, January 20, 2021.   

Proud grandparents Keith & Jane Bull. 
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